

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT A	LOT B One-ton cylinders	LOT B 150lb cylinders	LOT C bulk
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	\$ 0.26	\$ 0.33	\$ 0.55	\$ 1.60
2			Air Products	NB	NB	NB	NB
3			Air Gas	NB	NB	NB	NB
4			Brenntag Pacific	NB	NB	NB	\$ 1.8475
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	\$ 0.1448	NB	NB	\$ 1.52
6			Chemrite Inc	NB	NB	NB	NB
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	NB
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	NB
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	NB	NB
10			Kemira Water	\$ 0.222	NB	NB	NB
11			Univar USA	NB	NB	NB	\$ 1.3200
12			Polydyne	NB	NB	NB	NB

Notes: _____

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT C 53' ft short load	LOT D	LOT E	LOT F
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	\$ 1.60	NB	\$ 1.75	NB
2			Air Products	NB	NB	NB	NB
3			Air Gas	NB	NB	NB	NB
4			Brenntag Pacific	\$ 2.04	NB	NB	NB
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	\$ 1.59	\$ 0.1388	\$ 1.30	NB
6			Chemrite Inc	NB	NB	NB	NB
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	NB
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	NB
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	NB	NB
10			Kemira Water	NB	NB	NB	NB
11			Univar USA	\$ 1.3200	\$ 0.1430	\$ 1.4200	NB
12			Polydyne	NB	NB	NB	\$ 7.30

Notes: _____

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT G Bulk	LOT G 53' ft short load	LOT H	LOT I
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	\$ 1.85	\$ 1.85	NB	\$ 0.72
2			Air Products	NB	NB	NB	NB
3			Air Gas	NB	NB	NB	NB
4			Brenntag Pacific	NB	NB	\$ 0.96	NB
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	NB	NB	NB	\$ 1.02
6			Chemrite Inc	NB	NB	NB	NB
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	NB
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	NB
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	\$ 1.74	NB
10			Kemira Water	\$ 1.65	NB	NB	NB
11			Univar USA	NB	NB	\$ 1.0200	NB
12			Polydyne	NB	NB	NB	NB

Notes: _____

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT J	LOT K	LOT K Approved alt	LOT K Approved Alt
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	\$ 1.53	NB	NB	NB
2			Air Products	NB	NB	NB	NB
3			Air Gas	NB	NB	NB	NB
4			Brenntag Pacific	\$ 2.30	NB	\$ 36.20	NB
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	\$ 3.00	NB	NB	NB
6			Chemrite Inc	NB	NB	NB	NB
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	NB
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	NB
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	NB	NB
10			Kemira Water	NB	NB	NB	NB
11			Univar USA	\$ 2.2750	NB	NB	NB
12			Polydyne	NB	NB	NB	NB

Notes: _____

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT L	LOT M Bulk	LOT M Drums	LOT N
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	NB	\$ 1.32	\$ 1.81	NB
2			Air Products	NB	NB	NB	NB
3			Air Gas	NB	NB	NB	NB
4			Brenntag Pacific	\$ 2.935	\$ 1.28	\$ 4.10	NB
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	NB	\$ 2.60	NB	NB
6			Chemrite Inc	NB	NB	NB	\$ 10.26
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	NB
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	NB
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	NB	\$ 14.14
10			Kemira Water	NB	NB	NB	NB
11			Univar USA	NB	\$ 1.2400	NB	\$ 16.4000
12			Polydyne	NB	NB	NB	NB

Notes: _____

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT O	LOT P	LOT Q Barrels	LOT Q Bulk
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	\$ 2.40	NB	\$ 1.10	\$ 0.85
2			Air Products	NB	NB	NB	NB
3			Air Gas	NB	NB	NB	NB
4			Brenntag Pacific	NB	NB	NB	NB
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	NB	NB	NB	NB
6			Chemrite Inc	\$ 1.98	NB	NB	NB
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	NB
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	NB
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	NB	NB
10			Kemira Water	NB	NB	NB	NB
11			Univar USA	\$ 2.9700	NB	\$ 2.1140	NB
12			Polydyne	NB	\$ 10.56	NB	NB

Notes: _____

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT Q Mini-Bulk	LOT Q 53' ft Shortload	LOT R	LOT S
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	\$ 1.05	\$ 1.05	NB	NB
2			Air Products	NB	NB	NB	NB
3			Air Gas	NB	NB	NB	NB
4			Brenntag Pacific	NB	NB	\$ 4.48	\$ 0.885
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	NB	NB	NB	NB
6			Chemrite Inc	NB	NB	\$ 5.73	NB
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	NB
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	NB
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	\$ 6.25	NB
10			Kemira Water	NB	NB	NB	NB
11			Univar USA	NB	NB	NB	NB
12			Polydyne	NB	NB	NB	NB

Notes: _____

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE

AS READ BID/PROPOSAL TABULATION

INVITATION FOR BID #19PB001

DESCRIPTION: WATER & WASTE WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

OPENING DATE: 10/31/2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M., LOCAL TIME

OPENED BY: Cheryl Champine

READ BY: Karie Ingles

This tabulation reflects submittal data by the following companies read at the opening; however, they have not been reviewed or evaluated for accuracy of information. Final award decision will be determined once the complete evaluation has been completed.

	NO BID	BID/PERF BOND	COMPANY NAME	LOT T	LOT U	LOT V	
1			Hill Brothers Chemical Co.	NB	\$ 0.72	NB	
2			Air Products	\$ 0.0027	NB	NB	
3			Air Gas	\$ 0.0028	NB	NB	
4			Brenntag Pacific	NB	NB	\$ 10.10	
5			Thatcher Co of Arizona	NB	NB	\$ 8.00	
6			Chemrite Inc	NB	NB	\$ 8.64	
7			Sterling Water Technologies	NB	NB	NB	
8			Praxair	NB	NB	NB	
9			Shannon Chemical	NB	NB	NB	
10			Kemira Water	NB	NB	NB	
11			Univar USA	NB	\$ 1.6000	NB	
12			Polydyne	NB	NB	NB	

Notes: _____