Marked Agendas
Approved Minutes
Approved Reports




CERTIFICATE OF NO EFFECT 3-HP-2019

CITY OF .
SCOTTSDALE - HiSTORIC RESOURCES Knudson Residence
APPLICATION INFORMATION

LOCATION: 4817 N 78th PI APPLICANT: Lisa & Wayne Knudson
PARCEL: 173-30-3088 ADDRESS: 4817 N 78Th Pl Scottsdale, AZ 85251
€1:5.: 18-46 PHONE: 571-239-9317

Request: Request for approval of a Certificate of No Effect for an addition to an existing house, with Multiple-family
Residential Historic Property (R-5 HP) zoning, located at 4817 N. 78th Place.

Certificate of No Effect Criteria:
In accordance with the Section 6.122.D of the Zoning Ordinance, the Historic Preservation Officer:

e Finds that the proposed work is determined the proposed work is minor and clearly within the adopted Historic

Preservation Plan;

e Requires that any modifications to the proposed work requested by the Historic Preservation Officer are agreed to
by the owner/applicant; and

® Finds that the proposed work will not diminish, eliminate, or adversely affect the historic character of the subject
property or the HP District.

STIPULATIONS

1. Final Plans submittal for permitting shall be in conformance with the conceptual plans submitted with this
application, having a City staff approval dated 1/25/2019.

2. Exterior paint colors and outdoor light fixtures shall be in conformance with those identified with this submittal and
approved, having a City staff approval dated 1/25/2019.

CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENT PLAN REVIEW SUBMITTAL REQUIREMENTS

Submit one copy of this approval letter, a completed Owner/Builder form if applicable, and a permit
application along with plan sets as required for single-family residential additions to the One-Stop-Shop for
plan review:

https://www.scottsdaleaz.gov/planning-development/plan-review/requirements

Expiration of this Certificate of No Effect Determination

This approval expires two (2) years from date of approval if a permit has not been issued, or if no permit is
required, work for which approval has been granted has not been completed.

SIGNATURE: DATE:  1/25/2019

Jeff Barnes

Planning and Development Services
7447 E Indian School Road Suite 105, Scottsdale, AZ 85251 + www.ScottsdaleAZ.gov '
Page 1 of 1 Revision Date: 12/10/2014




Possini Euro Ratner 5 1/2" High Black LED
Outdoor Wall Light - style # 33143

***** 1 Review | 7 Questions, 8 Answers

$69.99

Compare $104.99

FREE SHIPPING & FREE RETURNS" | Low Price Guarante
SHIPS TODAY! (orders by 2pm Pacific)

1 ADD TO CART QO SAVE

Check Store Availability

Reinforce the refined and contemporary style outside your
home with this Ratner energy-efficient LED down light
outdoor wall light.

MORE DETAILS > 2-HP-317
STIPULATION SET

RETAIN FOR RECORDS
APPROVED

!
ATE INITIALS



Warm Hearth Foxtail
DE6110 DEC707

red tile roof on facia board/wood
eaves. Interior half wall facing office
doors at West elevation (not on
exterior of these half walls), Accent
arch above walkway to front door -
only to slump brick arch and carport
interior N and E walls for better
LRValue. In backyard on interior of
block wall to be stucco finish.

DE6110 Accent Color. Below 2nd story

DEC707 Body of home color
same as existing. On ALL exterior
facing walls, whole body of
home except for slump block
accents that will remain the
same -unpainted looking and on
N wall of carport that extends
outside of carport.

PULATION SEI?
HFTAIN FOR RECORDS

PPROVED
L 25719
DATE INITIALS




oy
LOT COVERAGE CALCULATION
EXISTING COVERAGE 2,258 SF
ADDITION _ 438 SF
TOTAL 2,696
2,696 / 6,000 = 449 % LCR i

_HP-2019
STIPULATION SET
REFMNFT%RRECORDS

PPROVED

9

DATE INITIALS

OPE_OF WORK
EXTEND EXISTING LIVING ROOM INTO REAR YARD

PROJECT DATA

HOMEOWNER WAYNE AND LISA KNUDSON
PROJECT ADDRESS 4817 NORTH 78TH PLACE
SCOTTSDALE, ARIZONA 8525
PARCEL APN# (73-30-3088
SECTION/TOWNSHIP/RANGE 23 N2 LE
SUBDIVISION VILLA MONTEREY 5, LOT 25
LOT SIZE 6,000 SF
MCR 10744
USE ATTACHED SINGLE FAMILY HOME
EXISTING HOME SIZE 1,955 SF LIVABLE (PER ASSESSOR)
PROPOSED ADDITION 83 SF AT BEDROOM
370 SF AT LIVING ROOM
2,L08 SF TOTAL

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

LOT 25, MONTEREY UNIT 5, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT OF

RECORD IN THE OFFICE OF THE COUNTY RECORDER OF

MARICOPA COUNTY, ARIZONA, RECORDED IN BOOK 107 OF MAPS,

PAGE 4L, TOGETHER WITH PARTY WALL RIGHTS AS SET FORTH

IN DECLARATION RECORDED IN DOCKET 5513 PAGE 583, 3
RECORDS OF MARICOPA COUNTY, ARIZONA, ASSESSOR'S PARCEL 2%
NUMBER A PORTION OF 173-30-308A

APPLICABLE CODES

CITY OF SCOTTSDALE ZONING ORDINANCE
2015 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE SocumeTaes
2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE ey i
(ORD. # L2B4, RESOLUTION #10597) PHOENI, NZONA 85018
(ORE. # 4284, RESOLUTION #10599) bt s
(ORF. # 4283, RESOLUTION #10598)

1SA|

1)

SHEET INDEX o A
C1.0 COVER AND SITE PLAN RN -

CLI SCOTTSDALE NOTES

Cl.2 GENERAL PROJECT NOTES
ALO EXISTING FLOOR PLAN
ALl PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN
A2.0 ELEVATIONS __mevmon_
SO STRUCTURAL PLANS S
EI.O ELECTRICAL PLAN -

+Seadetl) s, 4/ 0 ==
| ISSUED: 12/3/2018 I

COVER, INDEX
AND PLOT PLAN

C1.0




2015 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
2015 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE
2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

(ORD. # 4284, RESOLUTION #10597) (ORD. # 4284, RESOLUTION #10599) (ORD. #
4283, RESOLUTION #10598)

1. ALL PRODUCTS LISTED BY AN EVALUATION SERVICE REPORT (ESR) SHALL BE
INSTALLED PER THE REPORT AND THE MANUFACTURES WRITTEN INSTRUCTIONS.
PRODUCT SUBSTITUTIONS SHALL ALSO BE LISTED BY AN ESR.

2 PROVIDE FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM PER SCOTTSDALE FIRE CODE (IRC R313
AMENDED)

3 SEPARATE PERMITS REQUIRED: POOLS, SPAS, FENCES, SITE WALLS, RETAINING
WALLS, AND GAS STORAGE TANKS.

4 FOUNDATION & FOOTING DEPTH SHALL BE A MINIMUM OF 18 INCHES BELOW
GRADE (OR PER PROPERTY SOIL REPORT), PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF 3 INCH CLEARANCE
BETWEEN REBAR AND SOIL. (R403.1 AMENDED)

5 DOORS BETWEEN THE GARAGE AND RESIDENCE SHALL BE SELF-CLOSING
MINIMUM 1 3/8" THICK SOLID CORE OR 20 MINUTE FIRE RATED. (R302.5.1)

6. EXTERIOR WALL PENETRATIONS BY PIPES, DUCTS OR CONDUITS SHALL BE
SEALED. (R703.1)

7. WOOD SILL PLATES SHALL BE PRESSURE TREATED OR DECAY RESISTANT
EXTERIOR SILL PLATES SHALL BEAR A MINIMUM OF 6 INCHES ABOVE FINISH GRADE
(R317.1)

8 GYPSUM BOARD APPLIED TO A CEILING SHALL BE 1/2" WHEN FRAMING
MEMBERS ARE 16" 0.C. OR 5/8" WHEN FRAMING MEMBERS ARE 24" 0.C. OR USE
LABELED 1/2" SAG-RESISTANT GYPSUM CEILING BOARD. (TABLE R702.35 (D))

| SHOWERS AND TUB-SHOWER COMBINATIONS SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH
INDIVIDUAL CONTROL VALVES OF THE PRESSURE BALANCE OR THERMOSTATIC MIXING
VALVE TYPE. (P2708.4)

10.  SHOWER AREA WALLS SHALL BE FINISHED WITH A SMOOTH, HARD
NON-ABSORBENT SURFACE, SUCH AS CERAMIC TILE, TO A HEIGHT OF NOT LESS THAN
72 INCHES ABOVE THE DRAIN INLET. CEMENT, FIBER-CEMENT OR GLASS MAT GYPSUM
BACKERS INSTALLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH MANUFACTURERS' RECOMMENDATIONS
SHALL BE USED AS BACKERS FOR WALL TILE IN TUB AND SHOWER AREAS AND WALL
PANELS IN SHOWER AREAS. (R7024.2)

1 PLUMBING FIXTURES SHALL COMPLY WITH THE FOLLOWING CONSERVATION
REQUIREMENTS: WATER CLOSETS-TANK TYPE 1.28 GAL. /FLUSH. SHOWER HEADS- 2.0
GPM. SINKS- 2.2 GPM. LAVATORY-1.5 GPM (TABLE P2903.2 AMENDED)

12, STORAGE-TANK TYPE WATER HEATERS SHALL BE INSTALLED WITH A DRAIN
PAN AND DRAIN LINE. (P2801.6)

13, ADEMAND-CONTROLLED HOT WATER CIRCULATION SYSTEM SHALL BE
PROVIDED IN ACCORDANCE WITH AMENDED SECTIONS N1103.5.1.1 ANDN11035.1.2

14 PROVIDE ROOF/ATTIC VENTILATION UNLESS INSULATION IS APPLIED DIRECTLY
TO UNDERSIDE OF ROOF SHEATHING OR THE DIMENSION IS 24 INCHES OR LESS
BETWEEN THE CEILING AND BOTTOM OF ROOF SHEATHING. (R806.1 AMENDED)

15, THE BUILDING THERMAL ENVELOPE SHALL COMPLY WITH CLIMATE ZONE 2.
ENERGY COMPLIANCE SHALL BE DEMONSTRATED BY UA TRADE-OFF (RESCHECK) OR
PERFORMANCE (REM/RATE) COMPLIANCE PATH R BY THE FOLLOWING PRESCRIPTIVE
VALUES (TABLE N1102.1.2):

| PRESCRIPTIVE MINIMUM R-VALUES :
CEILING-R-38
WALLS=R-13

II. PRESCRIPTIVE MAXIMUM WINDOW FENESTRATION VALUES:
U-FACTOR=0.40
SHGC=0.25

16.  PROVIDE MINIMUM R-3 INSULATION ON HOT WATER PIPES. (N1103.5.3)

17. SUPPLY AND RETURN DUCTS IN ATTICS SHALL BE INSULATED TO A MINIMUM
R-8. DUCTS IN OTHER PORTIONS OF THE BUILDING SHALL BE INSULATED TO MINIMUM
R-6. DUCTS AND AIR HANDLERS LOCATED COMPLETELY INSIDE THE BUILDING
THERMAL ENVELOPE ARE EXEMPT. (N1103.3.1)

18.  REGISTERS, DIFFUSERS AND GRILLES SHALL BE MECHANICALLY FASTENED TO
RIGID SUPPORTS OR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS ON AT LEAST TWO OPPOSITE SIDES.

19, EXHAUST AIR FROM BATHROOMS, KITCHENS AND TOILET ROOMS SHALL BE
EXHAUSTED DIRECTLY TO THE OUTDOORS, NOT RECIRCULATED OR DISCHARGED
INDOORS. (M1507.2 AMENDED)

20.  EXHAUST FANS IN BATHROOMS WITH A SHOWER OR TUB SHALL BE PROVIDED
WITH A DELAY TIMER OR HUMIDITY/CONDENSATION CONTROL SENSOR. EXHAUST FANS
SHALL BE SWITCHED SEPARATELY FROM LIGHTING SYSTEMS. (R303.3)

21 MAWMMUOWMMWW;
OF A BATHROOM OR POWDER ROOM LAVATORY. (E3801.6)

22.  RECEPTACLES SERVING KITCHEN COUNTERTOPS INSTALLED IN BATHROOMS,
GARAGES, UNFINISHED ACCESSORY BUILDINGS, OUTDOORS AND LOCATED WITHIN 6
FEET OF SINKS SHALL HAVE GFCI PROTECTION FOR PERSONNEL. (E3002)

23, ALL BRANCH CIRCUITS THAT SUPPLY 15- AND 20-AMPERE OUTLETS INSTALLED
IN KITCHENS, FAMILY ROOMS, DINING ROOMS, LIVING ROOMS, PARLORS, LIBRARIES,
LAUNDRY AREAS AND SIMILAR ROOMS OR AREAS SHALL BE PROTECTED BY A
COMBINATION TYPE ARC-FAULT CIRCUIT INTERRUPTER (AFCI) INSTALLED TO PROVIDE
PROTECTION OF THE BRANCH CIRCUIT. (E3902.12)

24, GENERAL PURPOSE 15- AND 20-AMPERE RECEPTACLES SHALL BE LISTED
TAMPER-RESISTANT. (E4002.14)

25 PROVIDE SMOKE ALARMS IN NEW AND EXISTING AREAS OF HOME. (R314)

26 APPROVED CARBON MONOXIDE ALARMS SHALL BE INSTALLED OUTSIDE OF
EACH SEPARATE SLEEPING AREA IN THE IMMEDIATE VICINITY OF THE BEDROOMS IN
DWELLING UNITS WITHIN WHICH FUEL-FIRED APPLIANCES ARE INSTALLED AND IN
DWELLING UNITS THAT HAVE ATTACHED GARAGES. (R315)

27, AMINIMUM OF 90 PERCENT OF THE PERMANENTLY INSTALLED LIGHTING
FIXTURES SHALL CONTAIN ONLY HIGH-EFFICACY LAMPS. (N1104.1 AMENDED)

28 RECESSED LUMINAIRES INSTALLED IN THE BUILDING THERMAL ENVELOPE
SHALL BE IC-RATED AND LABELED AS HAVING AN AIR LEAKAGE RATE NOT MORE THAN
2.0 CFM. ALL RECESSED LUMINAIRES SHALL BE SEALED WITH A GASKET OR CAULK
BETWEEN THE HOUSING AND THE INTERIOR WALL OR CEILING COVERING. (N11024.5).

29.  PROVIDE ILLUMINATION WITH WALL SWITCHES FOR STAIRWAYS WHEN THERE
ARE 6 OR MORE RISERS. (R303.7)

30.  RECEPTACLE OUTLETS SHALL BE INSTALLED SO THAT NO POINT ALONG THE
FLOOR LINE IN ANY WALL SPACE IS MORE THAN 6 FEET, MEASURED HORIZONTALLY,
FROM AN OUTLET IN THAT SPACE, INCLUDING ANY WALL SPACE 2 FEET OR MORE IN
WIDTH. (£3901.2)

31, PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF TWO 20-AMP SMALL APPLIANCE BRANCH CIRCUITS
FOR THE KITCHEN/DINING/BREAKFAST . (E3703.2)

32 BOTH METAL PIPING SYSTEMS AND GROUNDED METAL PARTS IN CONTACT
WITH THE CIRCULATING WATER ASSOCIATED WITH A HYDROMASSAGE TUB SHALL BE
BONDED TOGETHER USING AN INSULATED, COVERED, OR BARE SOLID COPPER
BONDING JUMPER NOT SMALLER THAN B AWG (E4209)

33 PROVIDE OUTSIDE COMBUSTION AIR TO ALL INDOOR FIREPLACES WITH AR
INTAKE LOCATED NOT HIGHER THAN THE FIREBOX (R1006.1)

34 AT LEAST ONE THERMOSTAT SHALL BE PROVIDED FOR EACH SEPARATE
HEATING AND COOLING SYSTEM. (N1103.1)

- e

| HISTORIC PRESERVATION
SUBMITTAL

ISSUED: 3/13/2018 |

SCOTTSDALE NOTES

C1.1



B REACM EjREIFET §RE€3§33953 §8° 33 "33 §aEs AgARATST §9A SERRESIF ° "YHRSY QENS ° SO2eguge § GRP  SRERS 9By OQAR” YA R NRYNREE FPIERLCAIENING ESRS

AR B

i

MASONRY
FACE OF SUAS OR FACE OF STUD
FACE OF WAL
FIRE PROTECTON

Rt
FEET PER MUTE
FEET PER SECOND
FEE

oo

FooTeE:

FIELD Ve

SEERSSCERRE”

3 3 4% SEARET SERAEEART TIEFC I€IGEENEENTGH EEEA CJARt UEEE grgefegEese ageIIITIIIENGAIFAAROTT T 39 JRIITARN 9 eARE® IyagEAsT EFERGEE]

FASTENING SCHEDULE

ROOF STRUCTURAL MEMBERS
20815, | | =
AAFTERS OR TRUSSES TO TOP LATE OR | () 100 X TOF WAL EACH BN
OTHER FAAMING B6.0W TR0 LS
1) 14 GAGE STAPLES, 716" CROWN
woone ==
@Y 0 s O WAL EADH BN
7 14648 STARES
—
B0
FLAT BLOCKNG T0 TAUSS ANC WEB
A s
CELNG JOSTS [0 10 ANE -
4 100 80 TOENA EACH JOST
10710131 WALS
147 14 GAGE STAPLES, 116" CROWN
CELNG JOSTS D1 ATADD TO
PARALLEL W TER. LAPS OVER ™ 108 FACE
TN
COLLAR T TO WFTER ) 100 CoMMON
14) Y00 80X FAGE WAL
| T agrmes
107 14 GAGE SIARES. 178 SOWN
WAFTFR R ROOF TRUSS 10 TOP PLATE :::—
14) 100 80x ToE M.
0710131 WS
147 14 GAGE STAPLES. 716" CROWN
RODF AWFTERS 1D ROGE WALLEY DA Q:‘-‘”
P AAETIRS OR RODY WTER 0 2 ATl oW
0GE B () 7 14 GAGE STALES, 119 CROWN
3 100 CoMMON
(%) 160 80X
| 4 00 800 ToE
| 10 7 ag s [
1nruumm'u-
WALL STRUCTURAL MEMBERS
P STLO8 MO ATBACED WAL | 160 Con ]m:m:u
| [
'ncwm 8 00 FACE WAL
| ¥ 14 oAgE STAPLES 71 CROWN [
e O BB T ocrace wa
STUDS A7 BRACED WA L PANELS |
|1 oc st
7 06 Pt At
14 GAGE STALES. 77 CROW
BURLT-UP WEADIR, TWO OR MORE PECES | 160 COMMON 180 FACH FACE. FACT AL
YO FLUSH OUY WA STUDS BELOW 0 8 o |17 00 D FACE FACE WAL |
CONTRGED HAER. TWO PECES 140 ComEn 1 OC BACH FACE. FACE WAL
CONTIMUOUS HEAGER 10 STLD | 180 commeon 18 0C EACH FACE FACE WAL
| o s 17 0C FACH FACE FACE WAL
OURE TOP AATES 160 CoMN | oc racr e
100800
TR0 1T s 17 0C FACE AL
14 GAGE STALES 76 CROWN
DOUBLE TOP PUATES, MINIMUM 24-840 (8) 180 COMMON
P SPLCE AT ED JONTS (7 10080 FACK WAL EACH SI0E OF £0
0BT E013" LS JON! I OVERAPPED MEA
'n’“-mwm‘
BOTTOM PLATE T JOIST M OST, SAD | 160 COMMON |10 oc Face e
JOIST. M BLOCKING (NOT AT SRACED
L PANELS) 160 B0 [
FXOTITS | 12 oc pact
¥ 14 GAGE STWASS. 218 CROWN |
BOTTOM AATE TODST, A JOIST, SAND | () 160 COMMON
06T DAMOCKNG AT BMCD WAL |y 180 80K 00 FACE WAL
PANELS TR0 WS
(4) 7 14 GAGE STAPLES, 170" CROWN
ST 10 1P
4 100 K o
WT eI s
| 47 4 CAGE STAPLES. 17 DN |
—
@ 150 Conmon [
¥ 100 80X 0w
072013 WS
3 4 GAGE STAALES. 17 CROWN
TOP PATES, LAPS ATCORERE. A0 | g 140 COMMON At
WIERSEC O @ 0
@F 013 was
()7 4 GAGE STAPLES, 17" CROWN
0 COMMON
T BRACE Y0 EACH STUD AND PLATE \g.., FACE NAL
DF 01 was
@ T 4 GAGE SPLES. 71 CROWN
FLOOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS
OSTTOS TP AN CRGAGER | (B 80 COMMON
™ 080 -
@I 0TS
{37 14 GAGE STARLES, Ie CROWN
RN JOIST, AND JOIST ORBLOCONG T0 | 4D COMMON
10° PLATE. 51 O OTHER FRAMBG 100 0 00106 AL
BELow 1nm|--u
| ¥ 14 CAGE STARES, 11er CROWN
TP GADERS » Twrociacime
s | STAGERED T0° & SOTTOM
| | ow aPoPOSITE SI06S.
| voosox 200 1A WL |
Fa0 1S SIAGGHRD 10P 8 BOTIOM
14 GAGE STAPLES, 16 CROWN | ON OPVOSITE SRS
™ FACE WAL AT ENDS MO AT
2200 COMMON |
1008
TH0 15 WS
14 GAGE STAPLES, 1 CROWN |
oS |y | FACE NAlL AT EADH JOST 08
Py 1 10080
@ F a0 S
() 7 14 GAGE STAPLES. I8 CROWN
B 3160 COMMON CT
067 10 8AKD 0T 08 A OST 1@ 1008
0T 01 WS
0T 14 GAGE STAPLES. T CROWN
0 057, TR TOENAL AT EACH N0
o8 ThUSS

GENERAL STRUCTURAL NOTES

THE STRUCTURAL DRAWIGS SHOW T COMPLETED PROLECT TWEY DO NOT CLLDE

ANOOR 30L7S SWALL BE PLACED AT ALL

THE CONTRACTOR & R SHEAR WALL PLAN. UNO, ANCHOR BOLTS SHALL 5 MINMUM 1/2- DIAMETEA WITHA 7
RESPONSILI FOR SAFETY O AND AROUNO THE JORSITE DUNNG CONSTRUETIN EMBEDMENT AND SHALL BE LOCATED AT 40" 0C AND WITHIN 12* 0C PRESERVATIVE
S -
GENERAL STRUCTURAL NDTES SHALL BE USED ALDNG WITH THE SPECICATIONS ON THE ATTACHED 10 217
DAAWNGS WHER, THE STRUCTURA. NOTIS ORAWGS OR SPYCIFICATIONS DISAGREL T ACTUATED FASTENERS.AT &* OC THAOUSH AATES
v
Y SMPSON STRONG &
PROVIDE ALL TEMPOMAY SRACAG. SHORNEG. GUYNG 08 OTHER MEANS TO AVDD
AL AL L T 380
CONSTRUCTON. CIPANSYE WEDGIG ACTION
ESTAR 5 AND VIR ALL OPENIMGS, VOIS, AND NSERTS FOR WEMMICAL FLECTRICA NS
AN PLMBNG WIT) THE APPROPRATE TRADES. DAANGS AND SUBCONTRACTORS 08 SECHED O T AL
T0 CONTRCTON
AL DMUSINS WooR
NOTIY THE DESIGNER OF ANY OISCAEPANCIS OF NCONSISTENCIES.
STRUCIN OFTALS. OETALS AR APPLCABLE WHERE NOCATED Y SECTION CU1, BY S
NOTE OR BY DETAL TILE. L S B TREATED
ONERSE VE m--ﬂlm.—‘(—u
OTHERWISE 14 MOR: STRMGEN! REDMEMENTS Sk | I 0L RLES. e
2006 EDITION 05 THE WATONA.
? AND/OR VL 5.0%65 SHALL NOT EXCEED 195, UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED. ALL SAWN LUMBER SHALL 8
AL BEAR THE SEA.
N

(CMANGES TD THE DESIGN OF THE STRUCTURE WD ARE PROPOSED Y THE CONTRACTOR
SHALL BF SUBMITTED TD THE ARDTICT FOR REVIEW BY THE STRUCTURAL ENGINEER

" L 3 FOR THE ML
NOW-STRUCTURAL THE COST OF ANY
ESEN SHAL BE BORKE BY T

T+ COST OF DESIGN WORK RESLL WG #ROM ERRORS OR DMISSIONS v CONSTRUCTON
SHALL BE BORNE B THE CONTRACTOR

oo
REFER 103U DING PLANS COVER S 1

ROOF LIVE LOAD ;"ﬂmllm
WD L0AD 118 MPH (UL TIMATE) 20NE. EXPOSURE C

°
6.5 LIGHT FRAME SHEAR WALLS

SESWIC A FACTOR
sons
1.500PSF
RST AREAS SHALL MATCH THE EXSTING
FINSHED FLODA.

ALL FOOTINGS ARE TD BE FOUNDED AT NOT LESS THAN 16" BELOW | DWEST ADJACENT
FINISH FLOOR OR FNSH SRADE. (LOWER DEPTH GOVERNS). ONTD UNDISTURSED MATME
SORLS #AVING A MINIMUM SEARING CAPACTTY OF 1 500 PSF OUML ESS OTHERWISE NOTED
ON A SEALED SONS REPORT

BACKFLL EXCAVATIONS AS PROMPTLY AS WORK “ERMITS. SACKFILL ARDUND BLILDING ANO
UP 10 EDGE OF WALKS TO DRAN WAATER AWAY FROM BUILDING. LEAVE FINAL GRADE RAKED
SMOOTH

ALL ENGNEERED FLL SHALL BE COMPACTED 10 MIN 35% TEST UNLESS OT-EmeSE \0TED

EXCAVATON SOL WORK, FOUNDATIONS. COMPACTION, O ENGINEERED AL SHALL COMPLY
WITH MIN 95 COMPACTON TEST UNO

PAOVIOE CHEMICA. TERMITE TREATMINT 10 ALL AREAS UNDER FLOOR SUABS ON GRADE

uwmummuuummumw
MABITARLE SPACE CHEMICAL TERMITE TREATMENT SHALL BE APPLIED BY AN ARZDNA:

wmwmummuu-

EXTERION FATWORK

EXTERION FLATWORK SHALL RECEIVE SWEAT FVISH UNO. GARAGE FLATWORK SHALL RECEVE
BROOM FINSH

28 DAY COMPRESSVE STRENGTHS A 10 8 AS FOLLOWS.

ONDANDS 3,000 7S AT 28 DAYS. TYPE § CONCAETE § BAG M

FLOOR SLASS 2,000 5 AT 28 DAYS, MAX SUMP EQUAL 10 ¢
WALKS AND DRIVES 3,000 75 AT 20 DAYS

PROVIOE CONTAGL JOINTS PER CONTROL JOINT PLAN (F mbuumml
N AREAS AS SQUARE AS POSSISL | mm_mnluwu

AND OF UNFORM CONSISTENCY IN TERMS OF DETr AND WIDTH

CAST I\ PLACE CONCRETE.

PROVIDE ISOLATION JOINTS ARDUND ALL COLUMNS AT ALL EXPOSED 5LAB DN GRADE AREAS

ALL STRUCTURA. WD PLATES. LEDGERS. WM. ANDVOR JOSTE ¥ DIRECT CONTACT WITH
CONCRETE DR MASONRY SALL BF PRESERVATVE TREATED

ASOARY
CONCAETT MASONRY UNTS SHALL B 1,350 51 MIN, GRAOL N

ALL RENFORCING STEEL (RERAR
AND ARGER YO B ASTM 4815, GRADE 0. FY = 60 KL MO TWIST AL #2 AND #3 BARS 10
6 ASTW A 815, GAADE 40, NO TWIST DETAL ED, FASRICATED AND ERECTED I ACCORDANCE
WITH AC-318 LATEST ADOPTION.

OR TARS) SHALL B DEFDRMED STETL ALL BARS #4

WHERE AERAA (€ NOTED AS ‘CONTIMUOLS * USE AS FEW CONTAUOUS PECES OF RERAM AS
S PRACTICAL AND WHERE 5P ICES ARE NECESSARY. LAP MORZONTAL AND VERTICAL BARS
A MMM OF 40 BAR DINAETERS (70" MINIVUM) WITH APPROVED TiE WRRES.

O FACE OF O
SPRALS SHALL BE I CLEAR ON SIDES AND BOTTOM

STEEL BOLTS: ASTM-A-307, LATEST AISC HANDBOOK AND AW S CODES APPLY

AL BOLTS. ANCHOR BOLTS AND 801 7S I WASONRY (ROUT OR CONCRETE 10 8
EMRETIOND A MINIMUM O 7 UKD

AS A MINMUM, PROVOE L OwGER
THAN -, DOUBLE UP STUOS BELOW ALL BEAMS. DOUBLE UP JOSTS BELOW MECHANICAL
FQUIPMENT, AND PROVIOE 2% 3L DCKING AT MIO-HEIGHT OF ALL STRUCTURAL WALLS.

GLUE AMINATED BEAMS

0 B GRAE TC. DOUGLAS- 8 FOR
» NG

GLUED WITH WATERPRODF GLUE.

GLULAMS. SHALL HAVE THE FOLLOWNG MINIMUM PROPERTES
- 20008

V- 200PS
FC PEFDOCUAR 850 7S
£ = 18000008

AYwooo

ALL PLYWODD SHALL CONFOAM TD PRODUCT STANDARD 1-83 DR APA PRP- 108 AND HAVE
AN XTERIOR OR DXPDSUNT 1 DURASLITY CLASSFICATION. AND SHALL BEAR THE STAMP OF
AN ICC APPROVED TESTING AGENCY APA RATED SHEATHING 0F WAFRBOARD AND ORIENTED
STRAND BOARD) CONFORMIG 10 NER 138 AND WITH T FOLIVALENT EXPOSUNE

PLYWOOD LAY UP
STAGGER JONTS.

RODF SHEATHING 1D BE MINMUM 15/32° COX PLYWODD OR 716" 0SB (APA 32116 SPAN
INATED) WT 80 NALNG AT 1 OC ¥ FIELD AND # OC AT FULLY BLOCKED FDGES UNLESS

e AP AL ROOF
NSTALL #-CLPS ON
SHEATHNG AS AN O H-CLPS,
ATED TRG SHEATHING

EXTERION WALL SHEATHING TO S MINIMUM M2 EXPOSURE 1 PLYWOOD OF 0S8 WITH 80
NALING A7 12 OC N FIELD AND ' OC AT FULL Y BLOOKED EDGES UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED
AT BRACED WAL PLAN R S+EAR WALL PN

FLOOR SHEATHING SMALL BE MINIMUM | VI TAG WITH A 41724 SPAN RATING AND #1013 3
VT SCREWS AT 12
CONSTUCTION AD-ESVE (MMEADIATTLY PRIOR "D FASTENING SUBFLDOAING 10 FLOOR
STRUCTURE

L SISO TV 10 8 4
PR o
O
THE PUANS. REFER
SOEDUE
SPECIAL INSPECTIONS
P ™R owTER

"

8Y GEOTECHNICAL ENGINEER - GAADING EXCAVATION AND FLLING. DUIRING EARTHWORK
SAADING AND 1. 10 SATSP o«

OHWAPFTER 78 INCLUDING PACEMENT OF ENGINITRED FILL

STRUCTURA W DHG (INC: DG
\WELDING OF REINFORCING STEEL), EXCEPT WELDING PERFORMED IN A SHOP WHOSE WORK 1S
APPROVED BY THE BUMLOWG OF CIAL

Al TR0

COMMONLY USED FASTENERS

u: l R

- -

nr

DOCUMENTATION

p——
}

(:lltllll PERMIT SET I

SSUED.  JANARY 14, 2018




~HP-
§|PUU’~€?\@
RETAIN FOR RECORDS

APPROVED
ATFJ f;w’ ALS

e — i
7 !

i I

i I

&z

271 (NEW HEADER T0 ABOVE)
- - —

(B—Nn

SCALE: 1¢" = 1'0"




DRSTAG RESDENCH ¥ MOTAODD 3
PELLA RO ROAST FAANES o ~ o .
PANT STUCCO WALL TO MATCH RESDENCE -, ™\, 8
Aot SHEET METAL SRS \ \\ .
PANTED 1O MATDH STUCD L S =
] ¥
N P, - i
AN
B R = -
‘v 8 l
W / ¢ N I
! \ 2| '
————t 057 %G 86 RO0M 00RS 0 AMAN —_ .
W CONRED M0
D;vk Sky
(1) PROPOSED EAST ELEVATION__ vk Sy B
R ‘ SCALE: 18" = 1'0"

@) - 146 NORTH ELEVATION (SITE WALL OMITTED)

SCALE: 1 = 10

STUCO FINSH TO MATCH EXSTING RESIDENCE
COLOR OUNK {OWARDS XTI SOAL

/ﬁ xxxxxxxxxx =

TR COLOR OUNN EDWARS

s L]

\

1194 ST
\ \ N
v o
B T I ,
+ ig l ‘
K { {
)
| b / ’
-0 FISHED FLOOR (WATCH EXSTING) A1) ™ 1 y — ] — .
. BEONGE UNDER PATIO COVER. y, ==
4 0 AEMAN—

@_"_wm ELEVATION (SITE WALL

T SCALlE T =T
S:HE Jor?
RETAIN FOR RECORDS

: _Exishing Residence (olov
47 DumnéE wavds DECTO7 Foxta |

HISTORIC PRESERVATION
SUBMITTAL

APPROVED
flxé:fﬁ e

AYf 15 Jan'lq

ISSUED: 12/3/2018 I

ELEVATIONS

A2.0




@ LONGITUDINAL SECTION AT ADDITION

FAMILY ROOM

\|

USRS
T S SR Y

@M“

SCALE: 14" = 10

SCALE: /& =10

A
SN SRR,
B N e e A e S ]

SCALE: V& = 1'0°

SCALE 18 = 10

— 11 PARAPET

ronss

— 07 FNSHD FLOOR (MATCH DISTING)

ISSUED: (2/3/2018 l

STRUCTURAL PLANS

$1.0




SPECIFICATION SHALL PREVAIL
f
SMOKE DETECTORS SHALL BE HARDWIRED ANO INTERCONNECTED ON DEDICATED I | 74 \
CIRCUIT, VERIFY EXISTING SMOKE DETECTORS AT BEDROOMS AND AT HALLWAY OUISIDE p | & \
BEDROOMS. VERIFY CARBON MONCHDE DETECTOR. PROVIDE SWOKE DETECOTRS AND \ [
CARBON MONOXIDE DETECORS ON DEDICATED 15 AMP CRCUT I ABSENT D —— :&'
/ / | ~
PROVIDE GFI RECEPTACLE UL-LISTED FOR EXTERIOR USE WITHIN 207 AND LINE OF SIGHT ‘ / [ N\
OF HVAC OUTDOOR CONDENSING UNITS. THIS RECEPTACLE SHALL BE DN A 15- OR ‘ I |
20-AMP CRCLIT AND SHALL NOT BE CONNECTED TO THE LOAD SIDE OF HVAC / | 60
/ (

| ~ -
- -

NEv ol 19

8

PLANS AND WITH ACTUAL EQUIPMENT AS DELIVERED TD THE SITE PRIOR TD INSTALLATION [
|
|

PROVIDE ARC FAULT PROTECTION ['AFCF) T0 ALL 15- OR 20-AMP CIRCUITS SERVING NEW
GREAT ROOM ADDITION \
/ T NN

*\\\\\,\\ Ny \ }\

~

/

75% OF ALL LIGHTING TO HAVE HIGH-EFFICACY LAMPS TD MEET THE 2012 ECC
N \
N \

a'é//wzyz%

MAXIMUM OF 12 RECEPTACLES ON A SINGLE CIRCUIT
TYPICAL SWITCH BOXES 50" AFF

SWITCH AT HALL 2
TYPICAL RECEPTACLE BOXES 16° AFF UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED (WALL MOUNTED TV) / ~ -
RECEPTACLE AT 54" AFF FOR WALL MOUNTED FLAT SCREEN TV
PROVIDE STAPLES FROM WIRE TO CENTER OF STUD WITHIN 6° OF J-80XES
PROVIDE STAPLES FROM WIRE TO CENTER OF STUO @ 36" OC IN WALLS

PROVIDE 16GA METAL PLATES WHERE WIRES PASS THROUGH STUDS (SIMPSON NS1 OR
EQUVALENT)

'E
e e 9
Y
\

\
1]

Z
et

g

-
i
E
£
H

N
N . e

S

j\» <) o

ELECTRICAL POWER PLAN
® =S TREME T = T
-

hﬁeowmmmwmg

\
N
N |

! 2200 APPLANCE RECIPTCLE
€ 60 NCESSD N C T F ¥ RS TON
Q- WALL MOUNTED LGH' 1\

Q- WALL MOUNTED LIGHT FIXTURE LISTED FOR EXTEMIOR USE
w

CILING PN WITH LIGHT J30X LISTID TD SUPPORT 5085
SUBMITTAL

ISSUED: 3/13/2018 I

ELECTRICAL PLANS

E1.0




